TABULATION OF BIDS NAME/ADDRESS Heneghan and Associates Caldwell Tanks Maguire Iron
OF BIDDER 1004 State Highway 16 4000 Tower Road P.O. Box 1446
DATE & TIME: Friday — October 17, 2008 at 10:00 AM Jerseyville, IL 62025 Louisville, KY 40219 Sioux Falls, SD 57101
LOCATION:  City Hall, Bunker Hill, IL
Macoupin County
PROJECT: City of Bunker Hill BID BOND Engineers Estimate 5% 5%
150,000 or 100,000 Gallon Elevated Water
Storage Tank
ADDENDUM #1 #1 #1
FILE NO: 00330-419 BASE BID A - 150,000 GALLON LEGGED TANK, TIME OF COMPLETION 330 DAYS
ltem Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
No.
Elevated Water Storage Tank - complete with
1 foundations and painting, disinfection, L.S. 1
sampling, etc. 460,000.00 460,000.00 646,000.00 646,000.00
2 8" D.l. Pipe L.F. 42 65.00 2,730.00 72.00 3,024.00
6°x6” Tapping Sleeve w/6” Gate Valve w/box w/ Each
3 8"x6” Reducer 1 1,750.00 1,750.00 2,000.00 2,000.00
4 8” Gate Valve w/Box Each 2 1,260.00 2,520.00 1,150.00 2,300.00
5 5 % “ Fire Hydrant w/6” Gate Valve w/Box Each 1 3,000.00 3,000.00 4.000.00 4,000.00
6 Sample Station Each 1 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00
7 Site Fencing LS. 1 10,000.00 10,000.00 11,000.00 11,000.00
8 Site Work LS. 1 3,000.00 3,000.00 2,676.00 2,676.00
9 Demolition of Existing 75,000 Gal. Tank L.S. 1 50,000.00 50,000.00 15,000.00 15,000.00
TOTAL BASE BID A $535,000.00 $688,000.00 NO BID
BASE BID B - 100,000 GALLON LEGGED TANK, TIME OF COMPLETION 330 DAYS
ltem Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
No.
Elevated Water Storage Tank — complete with
1 foundations and painting, disinfection, L.S. 1
sampling, etc. 410,000.00 410,000.00 594,000.00 594,000.00
2 8" D.l. Pipe LF. 42 65.00 2,730.00 72.00 3,024.00
6°x6” Tapping Sleeve w/6” Gate Valve w/box w/
3 8"x6” Reducer Each 1 1,750.00 1,750.00 2,000.00 2,000.00
4 8” Gate Valve w/Box Each 2 1,260.00 2,520.00 1,150.00 2,300.00
5 5 % “ Fire Hydrant w/6” Gate Valve w/Box Each 1 3,000.00 3,000.00 4,000.00 4,000.00
6 Sample Station Each 1 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00
7 Site Fencing L.S. 1 10,000.00 10,000.00 11,000.00 11,000.00
8 Site Work LS. 1 3,000.00 3,000.00 2,676.00 2,676.00
9 Demolition of Existing 75,000 Gal. Tank L.S. 1 50,000.00 50,000.00 15,000.00 15,000.00
TOTAL BASE BID B $485,000.00 $636,000.00 NO BID
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TABULATION OF BIDS NAME/ADDRESS Heneghan and Associates Caldwell Tanks Maguire Iron
OF BIDDER 1004 State Highway 16 4000 Tower Road P.O. Box 1446
DATE & TIME: Friday — October 17, 2008 at 10:00 AM Jerseyville, IL 62025 Louisville, KY 40219 Sioux Falls, SD 57101
LOCATION:  City Hall, Bunker Hill, IL
Macoupin County
PROJECT: City of Bunker Hill BID BOND Engineers Estimate 5% 5%
150,000 or 100,000 Gallon Elevated Water
Storage Tank
ADDENDUM #1 #1 #1
FILE NO: 00330-419 BASE BID C — 150,000 GALLON LEGGED TANK, TIME OF COMPLETION 510 DAYS
ltem Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unif. Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
No.
Elevated Water Storage Tank — complete with
1 foundations and painting, disinfection, LS. 1
sampling, etc. 460,000.00 460,000.00
2 8" D.l. Pipe L.F. 42 65.00 2,730.00
6"x6” Tapping Sleeve w/6” Gate Valve w/box w/ Each
3 8"x6” Reducer 1 1,750.00 1,750.00
4 8" Gate Valve w/Box Each 2 1,260.00 2,520.00
5 5 % " Fire Hydrant w/6” Gate Valve w/Box Each 1 3,000.00 3,000.00
6 Sample Station Each 1 2,000.00 2,000.00
7 Site Fencing LS. 1 10,000.00 10,000.00
8 Site Work LS. 1 3,000.00 3,000.00
9 Demolition of Existing 75,000 Gal. Tank LS. 1 50,000.00 50,000.00
TOTAL BASE BID C $535,000.00 NO BID NO BID
BASE BID D - 100,000 GALLON LEGGED TANK, TIME OF COMPLETION 510 DAYS
ltem Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
No.
Elevated Water Storage Tank — complete with
1 foundations and painting, disinfection, L.S. 1
sampling, etc. 410,000.00 410,000.00
2 8" D.1. Pipe L.F. 42 65.00 2,730.00
6"x6” Tapping Sleeve w/6” Gate Valve w/box w/
3 8"x6” Reducer Each 1 1,750.00 1,750.00
4 8" Gate Valve w/Box Each 2 1,260.00 2,520.00
5 5 % " Fire Hydrant w/6” Gate Valve w/Box Each 1 3,000.00 3,000.00
6 Sample Station Each 1 2,000.00 2,000.00
7 Site Fencing L.S. 1 10,000.00 10,000.00
8 Site Work LS. 1 3,000.00 3,000.00
9 Demolition of Existing 75,000 Gal. Tank L.S. 1 50,000.00 50,000.00
TOTAL BASE BID D $485,000.00 NO BID NO BID
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TABULATION OF BIDS

DATE & TIME: Friday — October 17, 2008 at 10:00 AM

LOCATION:

City Hall, Bunker Hill, IL
Macoupin County

PROJECT: City of Bunker Hill

150,000 or 100,000 Gallon Elevated Water
Storage Tank

FILE NO: 00330-419

NAME/ADDRESS Heneghan and Associates Caldwell Tanks Maguire Iron
OF BIDDER 1004 State Highway 16 4000 Tower Road P.O. Box 1446
Jerseyville, IL 62025 Louisville, KY 40219 Sioux Falls, SD 57101
BID BOND Engineers Estimate 5% 5%
ADDENDUM #1 #1 #1

ALTERNATE BASE BID A — 150,000 GALLON PEDESTAL TANK, TIME OF COMPLETION 330 DAYS

ltem Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unif, Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
No.
Elevated Water Storage Tank — complete with
1 foundations and painting, disinfection, LS. 1
sampling, etc. 505,000.00 505,000.00 716,000.00 716,000.00 736,976.00 736,976.00
2 8" D.l. Pipe L.F. 42 65.00 2,730.00 72.00 3,024.00 72.00 3,024.00
6°x6” Tapping Sleeve w/6” Gate Valve w/box w/ Each
3 8"x6” Reducer 1 1,750.00 1,750.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,100.00 2,100.00
4 8" Gate Valve w/Box Each 2 1,260.00 2,520.00 1,150.00 2,300.00 1,200.00 2,400.00
5 5 % " Fire Hydrant w/6” Gate Valve w/Box Each 1 3,000.00 3,000.00 4,000.00 4,000.00 3,500.00 3,500.00
[ Sample Station Each 1 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00
7 Site Work L.S. 1 3,000.00 3,000.00 2,676.00 2,676.00 4,000.00 4,000.00
8 Demolition of Existing 75,000 Gal. Tank L.S. 1 50,000.00 50,000.00 15,000.00 15,000.00 16,000.00 16,000.00
TOTAL ALTERNATE BASE BID A $570,000.00 $747,000.00 $770,000.00
ALTERNATE BASE BID B - 100,000 GALLON PEDESTAL TANK, TIME OF COMPLETION 330 DAYS
ltem Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
No.
Elevated Water Storage Tank — complete with
1 foundations and painting, disinfection, L.S. 1
sampling, etc. 455,000.00 455,000.00 651,000.00 651,000.00 616,976.00 616,976.00
2 8" D.L Pipe LF. 42 65.00 2,730.00 72.00 3,024.00 72.00 3,024.00
6"x6” Tapping Sleeve w/6” Gate Valve w/box w/
3 8"x6” Reducer Each 1 1,750.00 1,750.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,100.00 2,100.00
4 8" Gate Valve w/Box Each 2 1,260.00 2,520.00 1,150.00 2,300.00 1,200.00 2,400.00
5 5 % “ Fire Hydrant w/6” Gate Valve w/Box Each 1 3,000.00 3,000.00 4,000.00 4,000.00 3,500.00 3,500.00
6 Sample Station Each 1 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00
7 Site Work L.S. 1 3,000.00 3,000.00 2,676.00 2,676.00 4,000.00 4,000.00
8 Demolition of Existing 75,000 Gal. Tank LS. 1 50,000.00 50,000.00 15,000.0.0 15,000.00 16,000.00 16,000.00
TOTAL ALTERNATE BASE BID B $520,000.00 $682,000.00 $650,000.00
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TABULATION OF BIDS

DATE & TIME: Friday — October 17, 2008 at 10:00 AM

LOCATION:

City Hall, Bunker Hill, IL
Macoupin County

PROJECT: City of Bunker Hill

150,000 or 100,000 Gallon Elevated Water
Storage Tank

FILE NO: 00330419

NAME/ADDRESS Heneghan and Associates Caldwell Tanks Maguire Iron
OF BIDDER 1004 State Highway 16 4000 Tower Road P.O. Box 1446
Jerseyville, IL 62025 Louisville, KY 40219 Sioux Falls, SD 57101
BID BOND Engineers Estimate 5% 5%
ADDENDUM #1 #1 #1

ALTERNATE BASE BID C - 150,000 GALLON PEDESTAL TANK, TIME OF COMPLETION 510 DAYS

ltem Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
No.
Elevated Water Storage Tank — complete with
1 foundations and painting, disinfection, L.S. 1
sampling, etc. 505,000.00 505,000.00 726,976.00 726,976.00
2 8" D.l. Pipe L.F. 42 65.00 2,730.00 72.00 3,024.00
6"x6” Tapping Sleeve w/6” Gate Valve w/box w/ Each
3 8"x6” Reducer 1 1,750.00 1,750.00 2,100.00 2,100.00
4 8” Gate Valve w/Box Each 2 1,260.00 2,520.00 1,200.00 2,400.00
5 5 %2 * Fire Hydrant w/6” Gate Valve w/Box Each 1 3,000.00 3,000.00 3,500.00 3,500.00
6 Sample Station Each 1 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00
7 Site Work L.S. 1 3,000.00 3,000.00 4,000.00 4,000.00
8 Demolition of Existing 75,000 Gal. Tank L.S. 1 50,000.00 50,000.00 16,000.00 16,000.00
TOTAL ALTERNATE BASE BID C $570,000.00 NO BID $760,000.00
ALTERNATE BASE BID D ~ 100,000 GALLON PEDESTAL TANK, TIME OF COMPLETION 510 DAYS
ltem Description Unit Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
No.
Elevated Water Storage Tank — complete with
1 foundations and painting, disinfection, L.S. 1
sampling, etc. 455,000.00 455,000.00 606,976.00 606,976.00
2 8" D.l. Pipe L.F. 42 65.00 2,730.00 72.00 3,024.00
6”x6” Tapping Sleeve w/6” Gate Valve w/box w/
3 8"x6” Reducer Each 1 1,750.00 1,750.00 2,100.00 2,100.00
4 8" Gate Valve w/Box Each 2 1,260.00 2,520.00 1,200.00 2,400.00
5 5 % “ Fire Hydrant w/6” Gate Valve w/Box Each 1 3,000.00 3,000.00 3,500.00 3,500.00
6 Sample Station Each 1 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00
7 Site Work LS. 1 3,000.00 3,000.00 4,000.00 4,000.00
8 Demolition of Existing 75,000 Gal. Tank LS. 1 50,000.00 50,000.00 16,000.00 16,000.00
TOTAL ALTERNATE BASE BID D $520,000.00 NO BID $640,000.00
|, TRACEY KELSEY, ENGINEER FOR THE CITY OF BUNKER HILL, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS I K Q/(A/
IS A TRUE AND CORRECT TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED AND OPENED ON OCTOBER 17, 2008 N— et et
AT 10:00 AM FOR THE CITY OF BUNKER HILL. ~ TRAC@ELSEY, P.E.@OJECT MANAGER
EGHAN & ARSQCIATES, P.C.
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