
ITEMS - BASE BID "A" QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
1 Pedestal Tank 150,000 Gallon (330 days) 1 EACH 390,000.00$              390,000.00$              473,800.00$              473,800.00$              468,370.00$              468,370.00$              482,600.00$              482,600.00$              516,425.00$              516,425.00$              
2 8" Ductile Iron Water Main 75 LF 80.00$                       6,000.00$                  44.00$                       3,300.00$                  30.00$                       2,250.00$                  60.00$                       4,500.00$                  55.00$                       4,125.00$                  
3 8" Gate Valve with Box 2 Each 1,200.00$                  2,400.00$                  1,500.00$                  3,000.00$                  1,300.00$                  2,600.00$                  1,500.00$                  3,000.00$                  1,350.00$                  2,700.00$                  
4 8" x 8" Tapping Sleeve with 8" Gate Valve & Box 1 EACH 3,000.00$                  3,000.00$                  2,500.00$                  2,500.00$                  4,500.00$                  4,500.00$                  3,900.00$                  3,900.00$                  3,800.00$                  3,800.00$                  
5 5 1/4" Fire Hydrant with 6" Gate Valve and Box 1 EACH 2,500.00$                  2,500.00$                  3,000.00$                  3,000.00$                  3,000.00$                  3,000.00$                  3,900.00$                  3,900.00$                  3,650.00$                  3,650.00$                  
6 Cut and Cap Existing 8" Water Main 1 EACH 2,000.00$                  2,000.00$                  5,000.00$                  5,000.00$                  300.00$                     300.00$                     1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  500.00$                     500.00$                     
7 1" P.E. Service Line 20 LF 5.00$                         100.00$                     5.00$                         100.00$                     4.00$                         80.00$                       35.00$                       700.00$                     150.00$                     3,000.00$                  
8 Curb Box for Sensing Line Tap 1 LS 1,500.00$                  1,500.00$                  200.00$                     200.00$                     200.00$                     200.00$                     150.00$                     150.00$                     100.00$                     100.00$                     
9 Concrete Splash Pad 1 LS 4,000.00$                  4,000.00$                  200.00$                     200.00$                     300.00$                     300.00$                     750.00$                     750.00$                     600.00$                     600.00$                     
10 Demolition of Existing 150,000 Gallon Standpipe 1 LS 15,000.00$                15,000.00$                10,000.00$                10,000.00$                12,000.00$                12,000.00$                12,000.00$                12,000.00$                11,000.00$                11,000.00$                
11 Demolition of Existing Tank Foundation 1 LS 7,000.00$                  7,000.00$                  7,000.00$                  7,000.00$                  2,000.00$                  2,000.00$                  6,000.00$                  6,000.00$                  7,000.00$                  7,000.00$                  
12 Disposal of Tank Materials 1 LS 2,000.00$                  2,000.00$                  2,000.00$                  2,000.00$                  6,000.00$                  6,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  -$                          -$                          
13 Disposal of Foundation Materials 1 LS 1,200.00$                  1,200.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  
14 Silt Fence 300 LF 2.00$                         600.00$                     5.00$                         1,500.00$                  3.00$                         900.00$                     3.00$                         900.00$                     3.00$                         900.00$                     
15 Temporary Erosion Seeding 1 EACH 1,500.00$                  1,500.00$                  500.00$                     500.00$                     500.00$                     500.00$                     500.00$                     500.00$                     400.00$                     400.00$                     
16 Site Work and Clean Up 1 LS 5,100.00$                  5,100.00$                  1,500.00$                  1,500.00$                  3,000.00$                  3,000.00$                  8,000.00$                  8,000.00$                  8,000.00$                  8,000.00$                  

17
Electrical (Installation of service, conduit, lights, 
recepticals, ect.) 1 LS 21,000.00$                21,000.00$                12,000.00$                12,000.00$                9,000.00$                  9,000.00$                  15,000.00$                15,000.00$                11,000.00$                11,000.00$                

18 Bacteriological Sampling 1 Each 100.00$                     100.00$                     300.00$                     300.00$                     1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  
19 Foundation Concrete Unit Price for Add/Deduct 0 CU YD -$                          -$                          350.00$                     -$                          250.00$                     -$                          325.00$                     -$                          325.00$                     -$                          
20 Reinforcement Steel Unit Price for Add/Deduct 0 POUND -$                          -$                          1.25$                         -$                          1.25$                         -$                          0.85$                         -$                          0.85$                         -$                          

21 Blasting and Painting Tank (Tnemec Coating System) 1 LS 115,000.00$              115,000.00$              125,000.00$              125,000.00$              120,000.00$              120,000.00$              109,000.00$              109,000.00$              112,000.00$              112,000.00$              
22 Containment 1 LS 80,000.00$                80,000.00$                20,000.00$                20,000.00$                60,000.00$                60,000.00$                45,000.00$                45,000.00$                42,000.00$                42,000.00$                
23 Cathodic Protection 1 LS 15,000.00$                15,000.00$                10,000.00$               10,000.00$               8,000.00$                 8,000.00$                 10,000.00$                10,000.00$                9,800.00$                 9,800.00$                 

TOTAL BASE BID AMOUNT
QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

1 Pedestal Tank 150,000 Gallon (510 days) 1 EACH 375,000.00$              375,000.00$              NO BID NO BID 474,370.00$              474,370.00$              482,600.00$              482,600.00$              516,425.00$              516,425.00$              
QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

21 Blasting and Painting Tank (Induron Coating System) 1 EACH 115,000.00$              115,000.00$              125,000.00$              125,000.00$              120,000.00$              120,000.00$              109,000.00$              109,000.00$              113,500.00$              113,500.00$              
QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

A-3 Raise Overflow Elevation of 150,000 Gallon to 120 Feet 1 EACH 20,000.00$                20,000.00$                11,900.00$                11,900.00$                10,000.00$                10,000.00$                12,000.00$                12,000.00$                3,700.00$                  3,700.00$                  

TOTAL BID AMOUNT WITH A-2 AND A-3 ACCEPTED

I,  Ronald M. Paul, P.E., engineer for the Village of Farmersville, do hereby certify that this is a true and correct tabulation of bids received
and opened on Friday, April 23, 2010 at 2:00 P.M., for the Village of Farmersville - Proposed 150,000 or 200,000 Gallon Elevated Water Storage Tank 

Caldwell Tanks, Inc. Maguire Iron, Inc.TABULATION OF BIDS - Proposed 150,000 or 200,000 NAME & ADDRESS Heneghan and Associates, P.C. - JV Phoenix Fabricators and Erectors, Inc. CB&I Constructors, Inc.
DATE & TIME: Friday, April 23, 2010 at 2:00 P.M. OF BIDDER 1004 State Highway 16 1329 US Highway 41 North 4000 Tower Road PO BOX 1446 1000 Remington Boulevard, Suite 105B
LOCATION:  Village of Farmersville Village Hall Jerseyville, IL 62052 Sebree, KY 42455 Louisville, KY 40219

0.05 0.05
Sioux Falls, SD 57101 Bolingbrook, IL 60440

PROJECT: Proposed 150,000 or 200,000 Gallon Elevated 
Water Storage Tank 

BID BOND Engineer's Estimate 0.05 0.05
ADDENDUM # 1 # 1 # 1 # 1 # 1

H&A FILE NO.:  00193-409

675,000.00$                                                  681,900.00$                                                 705,000.00$                                                 
ITEMS - ALTERNATE BID "A-1"

ITEMS - ALTERNATE BID "A-2"

ITEMS - ALTERNATE BID "A-3"

705,000.00$                                                 709,900.00$                                                  

709,900.00$                                                  739,000.00$                                                 

TOTAL BASE BID AMOUNT 675,000.00$                                                  681,900.00$                                                 739,000.00$                                                 
TOTAL BID AMOUNT WITH A-1 ACCEPTED 660,000.00$                                                  --- 711,000.00$                                                 709,900.00$                                                  739,000.00$                                                 

705,000.00$                                                 709,900.00$                                                  740,500.00$                                                 TOTAL BID AMOUNT WITH A-2 ACCEPTED 675,000.00$                                                  681,900.00$                                                 

721,000.00$                                                 721,900.00$                                                  
TOTAL BID AMOUNT WITH A-3 ACCEPTED 695,000.00$                                                  693,800.00$                                                 715,000.00$                                                 721,900.00$                                                  742,700.00$                                                 
TOTAL BID AMOUNT WITH A-1, A-2, AND A-3 ACCEPTED 680,000.00$                                                  --- 744,200.00$                                                 
TOTAL BID AMOUNT WITH A-1 AND A-3 ACCEPTED 680,000.00$                                                  --- 721,000.00$                                                 721,900.00$                                                  742,700.00$                                                 

695,000.00$                                                  693,800.00$                                                 715,000.00$                                                 721,900.00$                                                  744,200.00$                                                 

Ronald M. Paul, P.E. Project Engineer
HENEGHAN & ASSOCIATES, P.C.



QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
1 Pedestal Tank 200,000 Gallon (330 days) 1 EACH 537,000.00$              537,000.00$              542,500.00$              542,500.00$              557,425.00$              557,425.00$              567,370.00$              567,370.00$              572,700.00$              572,700.00$              
2 8" Ductile Iron Water Main 75 LF 80.00$                       6,000.00$                  44.00$                       3,300.00$                  55.00$                       4,125.00$                  30.00$                       2,250.00$                  60.00$                       4,500.00$                  
3 8" Gate Valve with Box 2 EACH 1,200.00$                  2,400.00$                  1,500.00$                  3,000.00$                  1,350.00$                  2,700.00$                  1,300.00$                  2,600.00$                  1,500.00$                  3,000.00$                  
4 8" x 8" Tapping Sleeve with 8" Gate Valve & Box 1 EACH 3,000.00$                  3,000.00$                  2,500.00$                  2,500.00$                  3,800.00$                  3,800.00$                  4,500.00$                  4,500.00$                  3,900.00$                  3,900.00$                  
5 5 1/4" Fire Hydrant with 6" Gate Valve and Box 1 EACH 2,500.00$                  2,500.00$                  3,000.00$                  3,000.00$                  3,650.00$                  3,650.00$                  3,000.00$                  3,000.00$                  3,900.00$                  3,900.00$                  
6 Cut and Cap Existing 8" Water Main 1 EACH 2,000.00$                  2,000.00$                  5,000.00$                  5,000.00$                  500.00$                     500.00$                     300.00$                     300.00$                     1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  
7 1" P.E. Service Line 20 LF 5.00$                         100.00$                     5.00$                         100.00$                     150.00$                     3,000.00$                  4.00$                         80.00$                       35.00$                       700.00$                     
8 Curb Box for Sensing Line Tap 1 LS 1,500.00$                  1,500.00$                  200.00$                     200.00$                     100.00$                     100.00$                     200.00$                     200.00$                     150.00$                     150.00$                     
9 Concrete Splash Pad 1 LS 4,000.00$                  4,000.00$                  200.00$                     200.00$                     600.00$                     600.00$                     300.00$                     300.00$                     750.00$                     750.00$                     
10 Demolition of Existing 150,000 Gallon Standpipe 1 LS 15,000.00$                15,000.00$                10,000.00$                10,000.00$                11,000.00$                11,000.00$                12,000.00$                12,000.00$                12,000.00$                12,000.00$                
11 Demolition of Existing Tank Foundation 1 LS 7,000.00$                  7,000.00$                  7,000.00$                  7,000.00$                  7,000.00$                  7,000.00$                  2,000.00$                  2,000.00$                  6,000.00$                  6,000.00$                  
12 Disposal of Tank Materials 1 LS 2,000.00$                  2,000.00$                  2,000.00$                  2,000.00$                  -$                          -$                          6,000.00$                  6,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  
13 Disposal of Foundation Materials 1 LS 1,200.00$                  1,200.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  
14 Silt Fence 300 LF 4.00$                         1,200.00$                  5.00$                         1,500.00$                  3.00$                         900.00$                     3.00$                         900.00$                     3.00$                         900.00$                     
15 Temporary Erosion Seeding 1 EACH 1,500.00$                  1,500.00$                  500.00$                     500.00$                     400.00$                     400.00$                     500.00$                     500.00$                     500.00$                     500.00$                     
16 Site Work and Clean Up 1 LS 2.00$                         2.00$                         1,500.00$                  1,500.00$                  8,000.00$                  8,000.00$                  3,000.00$                  3,000.00$                  8,000.00$                  8,000.00$                  

17
Electrical (Installation of service, conduit, lights, 
recepticals, ect.) 1 LS 21,000.00$                21,000.00$                12,000.00$                12,000.00$                11,000.00$                11,000.00$                9,000.00$                  9,000.00$                  15,000.00$                15,000.00$                

18 Bacteriological Sampling 1 EACH 100.00$                     100.00$                     300.00$                     300.00$                     1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  1,000.00$                  
19 Foundation Concrete Unit Price for Add/Deduct 0 CU YD -$                          -$                          350.00$                     -$                          325.00$                     -$                          250.00$                     -$                          325.00$                     -$                          
20 Reinforcement Steel Unit Price for Add/Deduct 0 POUND -$                          -$                          1.25$                         -$                          0.85$                         -$                          1.25$                         -$                          0.85$                         -$                          

21 Blasting and Painting Tank (Tnemec Coating System) 1 LS 138,000.00$              138,000.00$              135,000.00$              135,000.00$              130,000.00$              130,000.00$              130,000.00$              130,000.00$              129,000.00$              129,000.00$              
22 Containment 1 LS 80,000.00$                80,000.00$                20,000.00$                20,000.00$                42,000.00$                42,000.00$                60,000.00$                60,000.00$                50,000.00$                50,000.00$                
23 Cathodic Protection 1 LS 15,000.00$                15,000.00$                10,000.00$               10,000.00$               9,800.00$                 9,800.00$                 8,000.00$                  8,000.00$                  10,000.00$               10,000.00$               

TOTAL BID AMOUNT
QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

1 Pedestal Tank 200,000 Gallon (510 days) 1 EACH 375,000.00$              375,000.00$              NO BID NO BID 557,425.00$              557,425.00$              572,370.00$              572,370.00$              572,700.00$              572,700.00$              
QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

21 Blasting and Painting Tank (Induron Coating System) 1 EACH 115,000.00$              115,000.00$              135,000.00$              135,000.00$              132,000.00$              132,000.00$              130,000.00$              130,000.00$              129,000.00$              129,000.00$              
QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

B-3 Raise Overflow Elevation of 200,000 Gallon to 120 Feet 1 EACH 20,000.00$                20,000.00$                11,500.00$                11,500.00$                6,900.00$                  6,900.00$                  12,000.00$                12,000.00$                8,000.00$                  8,000.00$                  

I,  Ronald M. Paul, P.E., engineer for the Village of Farmersville, do hereby certify that this is a true and correct tabulation of bids received
and opened on Friday, April 23, 2010 at 2:00 P.M., for the Village of Farmersville - Proposed 150,000 or 200,000 Gallon Elevated Water Storage Tank 

TABULATION OF BIDS - Proposed 150,000 or 200,000 NAME & ADDRESS Heneghan and Associates, P.C. - JV Phoenix Fabricators and Erectors, Inc. CB&I Constructors, Inc. Caldwell Tanks, Inc. Maguire Iron, Inc.
DATE & TIME: Friday, April 23, 2010 at 2:00 P.M. OF BIDDER 1004 State Highway 16 1329 US Highway 41 North 1000 Remington Boulevard, Suite 105B 4000 Tower Road PO BOX 1446
LOCATION:  Village of Farmersville Village Hall Jerseyville, IL 62052 Sebree, KY 42455 Bolingbrook, IL 60440 Louisville, KY 40219 Sioux Falls, SD 57101

# 1 # 1
PROJECT: Proposed 150,000 or 200,000 Gallon Elevated 

Water Storage Tank 
BID BOND Engineer's Estimate 0.05 0.05 0.05

ADDENDUM # 1 # 1 # 1
0.05

814,000.00$                                                  

H&A FILE NO.:  00193-409

-$                        840,502.00$                                                  760,600.00$                                                 798,000.00$                                                 
ITEMS - ALTERNATE BID "B-1"

ITEMS - ALTERNATE BID "B-2"

ITEMS - ALTERNATE BID "B-3"

ITEMS - BASE BID "B"

825,000.00$                                                 

798,000.00$                                                 819,000.00$                                                  
TOTAL BASE BID AMOUNT 840,502.00$                                                  760,600.00$                                                 798,000.00$                                                 814,000.00$                                                  825,000.00$                                                 
TOTAL BID AMOUNT WITH B-1 ACCEPTED 678,502.00$                                                  --- 825,000.00$                                                 
TOTAL BID AMOUNT WITH B-2 ACCEPTED 817,502.00$                                                  760,600.00$                                                 800,000.00$                                                 814,000.00$                                                  825,000.00$                                                 

804,900.00$                                                 826,000.00$                                                  833,000.00$                                                 TOTAL BID AMOUNT WITH B-3 ACCEPTED 860,502.00$                                                  772,100.00$                                                 

804,900.00$                                                 831,000.00$                                                  
TOTAL BID AMOUNT WITH B-1, B-2, AND B-3 ACCEPTED 675,502.00$                                                  --- 806,900.00$                                                 831,000.00$                                                  833,000.00$                                                 
TOTAL BID AMOUNT WITH B-1 AND B-3 ACCEPTED 698,502.00$                                                  ---
TOTAL BID AMOUNT WITH B-2 AND B-3 ACCEPTED 837,502.00$                                                  772,100.00$                                                 

833,000.00$                                                 
833,000.00$                                                 

Ronald M. Paul, P.E. Project Engineer
HENEGHAN & ASSOCIATES, P.C.

806,900.00$                                                 826,000.00$                                                  


